
From wearing face masks in public to homeschool-

ing our kids, we all find ourselves doing things we 

could not have imagined just three months ago. For 

the two of us, that includes spending far more time 

than usual outside the courtroom. Since late March, 

jury trials have ground to a halt in the wake of the 

pandemic. Now, as states tentatively reopen, courts 

across the country are grappling with unprecedented 

challenges to resuming jury trials safely.

This article explores how one of the most socially 

interactive legal processes—jury selection—can con-

form to social-distancing guidelines, along with ways 

the pandemic itself might influence the jury pool and 

affect deliberations.

Jury Selection
Jury selection as we know it is by no means a socially 

distant process. Courts typically summon hundreds of 

prospective jurors at once into small courtrooms and 

pack them into rows, where they are asked to pass out 

forms and share pens and clipboards. They are asked 

questions by multiple lawyers, and maybe even the 

judge, all in close proximity. They are trapped inside, 

sometimes for an entire day. This practice, which once 

seemed so normal, now makes us cringe. How can 

courts continue to conduct jury selection in a post-

pandemic world?

One possible solution is to whittle down the num-

ber of jurors with mail-in or online questionnaires. A 

preliminary hardship questionnaire would be used in 

advance of individual voir dire to prescreen those who 

cannot serve due to recognized hardships, such as 

financial difficulties or child care responsibilities. In 

a second phase, a case-specific questionnaire devel-

oped by the parties would be accessible to jurors to 

further screen for bias and could even form the basis 

of the parties’ cause and peremptory challenges. If 

desired, the judge or counsel could conduct addi-

tional inquiry with individual jurors via telephone or 

videoconference.

Another solution may be to alter the location of 

jury selection. Some courts have proposed moving 

them to larger venues, such as convention centers or 

movie theaters. Others suggest relying on videocon-

ferencing technology to conduct voir dire orally. One 

Dallas judge recently implemented this approach with 

more than two dozen prospective jurors, asking them 

to raise their hands in response to questions about 
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potential bias and permitting the 
lawyers to ask follow-up questions.

Courts may also conduct jury 
selection in smaller, staggered 
groups, with selection proceeding 
as usual, but in several stages of 
smaller groups, arriving on differ-
ent days and at different times. 
Alternatively, individual jurors 
could be instructed to arrive at 
specific interview times, with each 
side having an equal amount of 
time to question each juror until 
a sufficient number have been 
passed for cause.

Lastly, some courts may opt to use 
smaller juries. While federal courts 
and some states already operate 
with just six jurors in civil trials, 
the laws in many others allow the 
parties to stipulate to juries with 
fewer jurors than prescribed by 
statute. A smaller jury reduces the 
number needed for jury selection 
and could better satisfy spacing 
restrictions in the jury box and 
deliberation room.

Jury Pool Composition and 
Jury Deliberations

The pandemic not only poses 
significant social-distancing chal-
lenges to jury selection, but also 
threatens to undermine the repre-
sentative makeup of juries and spur 
more acrimonious deliberations.

Because seniors and those with 
preexisting health conditions are 
especially vulnerable to COVID-19, 
judges are more likely to excuse 
these individuals from jury service. 
Such a result may harm defen-
dants, as older jurors tend to be 

more conservative and more recep-
tive to defense themes. On the 
other hand, excusal of those with 
underlying health conditions may 
benefit defendants, because those 
individuals may be more sympa-
thetic to plaintiffs seeking compen-
sation for their injuries.

Some people may simply refuse 
to participate in jury duty due 
to fears of contracting the virus. 
Recent polling demonstrates a clear 
association between political ideol-
ogy and the level of concern related 
to the virus, with conservatives 
(who often side with civil defen-
dants) tending to be less apprehen-
sive than their liberal peers (who 
are often plaintiff-friendly).

Moreover, prior studies have 
shown that jurors who exhibit 
anxiety-related responses to health 
and safety threats, even if unre-
lated to the underlying lawsuit, 
are more likely to support plaintiffs 
in tort cases. Thus, a large-scale 
excusal of those acutely concerned 
about COVID-19 would probably 
benefit defendants.

The pandemic may also affect 
jury decision-making. For exam-
ple, inconsistent and sometimes 
conflicting messages from regu-
latory bodies and government 
officials have spawned increased 
distrust of the government, mean-
ing that jurors may lack confidence 
in what authorities are doing to 
protect people from health hazards. 
This could spell trouble for defen-
dants who rely on their adherence 
to government regulations as a 

defense to liability. Quite inter-
estingly, opinion polls have also 
demonstrated that the pandemic 
has exacerbated “confirmation 
bias” among the population—e.g., 
those who previously held posi-
tive attitudes toward corporations 
viewed corporate responses to the 
pandemic positively, while those 
with negative beliefs viewed the 
same responses skeptically, further 
intensifying their negative feel-
ings. This polarization might lead 
to more contentious deliberations 
and hung juries.

The world as we know it has 
drastically changed, and the court-
room is no exception. Every aspect 
of the jury trial, from selection to 
deliberations, will be affected by 
the ongoing pandemic. But the 
show must go on, so litigants and 
courts alike must embrace mea-
sures that both protect prospective 
jurors’ well-being and each party’s 
right to a fair and impartial jury.
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